








he Swedish 1-m Solar Tele-
scope (SST), operated by the 
Institute for Solar Physics of 

Stockholm University, is a vacuum 
telescope with a 1.1 meter lens as 
its first optical element. When 
opened in 2002, SST immediately 
acquired images with a spatial 
resolution of 0.1 arcseconds – 
corresponding to 70 km on the 
Sun. No other telescope had ever 
shown so small solar details. This 
was a major leap for observational 
solar physics.

With outstanding optical quality 
and unique spectropolarimetric 
instrumentation, SST observes 
solar fine structure and magnetic 
fields at unprecedented spatial 
resolution and low noise. In 2016 
scientists rejoiced over images 
from a blue-light filter system 
called CHROMIS, which has 
opened a new window for explora-
tion of the dynamic and magnetic 
chromosphere.
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Einsteinturm
(Potsdam, Germany)

he Einsteinturm (Leibniz-Ins-
titut für Astrophysik Pots-
dam, Germany) was the first 

tower solar telescope constructed 
in Europe in the early 1920s. It was 
used to detect the gravitational 
redshift predicted theoretically by 
Einstein, but with no success. 
However, the observations led 
Schröter to propose a two-stream 
model for the solar granulation. 

Measurements of the solar spec-
trum with the spectrograph of the 
Einsteinturm led to the develop-
ment of the Grotrian diagram (a 
graphical representation of elec-
tron transitions in atoms). 

The Einsteinturm performed many 
observations of magnetic fields in 
sunspots. One of the major 
findings was the discovery of so-ca-
lled delta spots (sunspots with 
opposite polarities inside one 
penumbra) by Künzel in the 1960s.
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Vacuum Tower Telescope
(Observatorio del Teide, Tenerife)

he German Vacuum Tower 
Telescope (VTT) is operated 
by the Kiepenheuer-Institut 

für Sonnenphysik (KIS) in coopera-
tion with the Leibniz-Institut für 
Astrophysik Potsdam (AIP) and the 
Max-Planck Institute für Son-
nensystemforschung (MPS). 

It is a classical solar telescope: two 
coelostat mirrors feed the sunlight 
into the telescope. The primary 
mirror has a diameter of 70 cm and 
a focal length of 46 m. The telesco-
pe is inside a building with a height 
of some 38 m spanning more than 
10 floors. 

The VTT offers several large optical 
laboratories for all kinds of perma-
nent and temporary optical setups.
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